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15/7/2020,
Hyderabad
To,
Dr.M. Kiranmai,
Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy,
Dear madam,
Sub: Acceptance of consultancy project...reg

[ am writing you this letter with reference to your mail dated 13/7/2020regarding the new
project entitled Design and Evaluation of Chrono Modulated Drug Delivery Systems by
Selected Drugs. I am sending you my confirmation on behalf of Sura Labs regarding the
project allotted to you. we want you to initiate working on this at your earliest. We agree
about all the norms, terms and conditions and budget put forward by your team. Do let us
know if you need any further details regarding the same. With regards.

4th Floor, S.S. Towers, Beside Chandana Brothers, Dilsukhnagar, Hyderabad - 590 060, T.S., India.
Tel: +91 40 40175392, +91 9951919887, E-mail: suralabshyd@gmail.com



3714720, 3:53 PM Gmail - Fwd: Regarding Consultancy Project

M Gmail

Fwd: Regarding Consultancy Project

1 message

Mon, Mar 13, 2020 at 10:40 AM

~eemeeee Forwarded message ~ee-sees

From: Dr Kiranmaim <drkiranmaim@stpaulscollege.ac.in>
Date:Mon,Mar 13, 2020 at 11:32 AM

Subject: Fwd: Regarding Consultancy Project

To: <office@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

et - Forwarded message =~

From: VijayDeep Suralabs <nellurivijaydeep.suralabs@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Mar 13, 2020 at 10:40 AM

Subject: Regarding Consultancy Project

To: <drkiranmaim@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

Respected Sir/Madam;

With the subject cited above, we hereby request you to express your willingness regarding consultancy project discussed in
our previous meeting. please quote the budget for the same.

Regards ,
N.Vijaydeep,
Manager , Sura Labs.

oG

hnps;mnaﬂ.%ao.oalb.c,onvmailj/wo?iksﬁrsmﬁszafdavxmpt&saarcn=qli&pam1ﬁ_ld=’u1raad-z%am‘zmao?aseaiszqazzsa'simm=msg-mmi7163073‘5933... 11



7413720, 4:46 PM

M Gmail

Fwd: Sub: Acceptance of the proposal

1 message

Gmail - Fwd: Sub: Acceptanice of the proposat

Mon, Jul, 13, 2020:at 10:45 AM

~r=a---e-- Forwarded message --—-----

From: Dr Kiranmaim <drkiranmaim@stpaulscoilege.ac.in>
Date: Mon, Jul, 13, 2020at 3:26 PM

Subject: Fwd: Sub: Acceptance of the proposal

To: Office St. Paul's college <office@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

--------— Forwarded message ---------
From: Dr Kiranmaim <drkiranmaim@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

Date: Mon, Jul, 13, 2020:at 10:45 AM
Subject: Sub: Acceptance of the proposal
To: <nellurivijaydeep.suralabs@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,

With reference to your previous mail, we are glad to inform you of our acceptance towards your

proposal regarding consultancy projects. Please find the attachment containing stages of work and

cost analysis.

with regards,

Dr.K. Kiranmai M. Pharm PhD,

Professor,

St. Pauls college of Pharmacy

2 Cost analysis 1 (2020-21) (1).pdf
568K

UG~

hitps:/mail. google.com/mailw0?ik=6f51552dfdaview=pt&search=all&permihid=thread-1%3A17 10807682151 747 182&simpl=msg-1te3A171080765215. .,
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9/16120, 4'24. PM Gmait - Fwd: Acceptance

M Gmail

Fwd: Acceptance
1 message

Mon; Sep 14, 2020 at '11:00 AM

----- -- Forwarded message ---------

From: Dr Kiranmaim <drkiranmaim@stpaulscollege ac.in>
Date: Mon, Sep 14, 2020 at 11:29 AM

Subject: Fwd: Acceptance

To: <office@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

sensassnss Forwarded message =--sse---

From: ViiavDeep Suralabs <nelluriviavdeep.suralabs@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Sep 14, 2020 at '11:00 AM

Subject: Acceptance

To: <drkiranmaim@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

Respected Madam/Sir,

We are pleased to Inform you that we are releasing:an Initfal -amount of rupees 50000 towards the project fees.

Regards ,
N.Vijaydeep,
Manager, Sura Labs.

TG,

htips://mail.google.com/mailiu/0?ik=6f6 1652dfd&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-%2A17108074503 32874659&simpl=msg-1%3A171080745033... 11
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15/7/2020,

Hyderabad
To,

Dr.M. Kiranmai,

Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy,

Dear madam,

Sub: Acceptance of consultancy project...reg

[ am writing you this letter with reference to your mail dated 13/7/2020regarding the new
project entitled Design and Evaluation of Chrono Modulated Drug Delivery Systems by
Selected Drugs. I am sending you my confirmation on behalf of Sura Labs regarding the
project allotted to you. we want you to initiate working on this at your earliest. We agree
about all the norms, terms and conditions and budget put forward by your team. Do let us
know if you need any further details regarding the same. With regards.
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4th Floor, S.S. Towers, Beside Chandana Brothers, Dilsukhnagar, Hyderabad - 5(_)0 060, T.S., India.
Tel: +91 40 40175392, +91 9951919887, E-mail: suralabshyd@gmail.com



Design and Evaluation of Chronomodulated Drug
Delivery system by selected Drugs

A Consultancy Project

Submitted to
Sura Labs — Hyderabad
By I
Dr. Kirammai Mandava M. Pharm PhD
Professor,

St.Pauls College of Pharmacy
Mrs.P.Naga HarithaM.Pharm (PhD)

Assistant Professor,

St.Pauls College of Pharmacy

Department of Pharmaceutics,

St.Pauls

© College of Pharmacy

(Approved by AICTE, PCl and Afiliated to Osmanla Unlversity)

Turkhyamzal, Abdullapurmet (M)-501510,

Rangareddy Dist,

Telangana E E

June-2021
Principal
St. Paul’s College of Pharmacv
Turkayemjal, R.R District



St.Pauls

College of Pharmacy
{Approved by AICTE, PCl and Affillated to Osmanla University)
2020-2021

Title: Design and Evaluation of Chronomodulated Drug Delivery system by
selected Drugs.

Principal Investigator: Dr. Kirammai Mandava M. Pharm PhD

Co-Investigator: Mrs.P. Naga Haritha M. Pharm (PhD)

Stages of Work
B & % 2 — ._ = — e ——— S ——
. o literature review
AR .
i I Procurement of Chemlcals_____l -
— ————— ——
932 ¢ Preparation of Formulations
‘Weeks - : = : s
334 * Characterization & Evaluation
weeks
Cost Analysis
1 Man power
2 Consumables 85,550 !
3 Contingencies 25,000
5 Overhead Charges 15,000
Total 215000 |

O e N

Principal Principal Investigator Co-Investigator




INCEPTION
SOURCE.....

We findTqutions

Date: 12/6/2019,
Hyderabad.

To

Dr K. VENUMADHAY,
Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad.

Dear Sir,

Sub: Acceptance of Consultancy Projects

With reference to our previous meeting dated 10/4/2019 regarding our collaborative project
entitled Formulation and Evaluation of Self Nano Emulsifying Drug Delivery system for
Tamoxifen, we are delighted to express our acceptance. We request you to start the work
immediately and we also look forward to submit in stipulated time. Inception source Pvt ltd is
always ready to consider your valuable suggestions and any constructive changes towards the

project. Thank you.

Yours Sincerely,

Director,
Inception Source

Inception Source Pvt. Ltd.

A Corporate Office: H. No: 11-13-1427, 2nd Floor, Nirmal Sadan, Kothapet, Hyderabad - 35



Formulation and Evaluation of Self Nano-
Emulsifying Drug Delivery System (SNEDDS) for
Tamoxifen

A Consultancy Project

Submitted to
Inception Source Pvt Ltd — Hyderabad
By
Dr. K.VenuMadhavM.Pharm PhD
Professor,
Department of Pharmaceutics

St.Pauls College of Pharmacy,

8 St.Pauls

College of Pharmacy
(Approved by AICTE, PCl and Affiliated to Osmania University)
Turkhyamzal, Abdullapurmet (M)-501510,
RangareddyDist,
Telangana

May-2020



@ St.Pauls

@ College of Pharmacy

{Approved by AICTE, PCl and Affiliated to Osmania University)

2019-2020

Tilte: Formulation and Evaluation of Self Nano-Emulsifying Drug Delivery System
(SNEDDS) for Tamoxifen

Principal Investigator: Dr. K.Venu Madhav M.Pharm PhD
Co-Investigator: Dr.Ayesha Sultana M. Pharm PhD

Stages of Work

¢ literature review
* Procurement of Chemicals

* Preparation of Formulations

e Characterization & Evaluation

Cost Analysis
B 1 - ~ Manpower - 56221 ]
2 - ~ Consumables - - 128779 |
4 " Contingencies 25000 |
s _ Overhead Charges 15000 {
~ Total _ 225,000 '




412019, 351 PM Gmail - Fwd: Proposal of consultancy project:
Lo~ ¥
M Gmail

Fwd: Proposal of consultancy project.
1 message

Wed, Apr 10, 2019 at2:57 PM

Forwarded message s-vea-us
From: <info@incentionsource.in>

Date: Wed, Apr 10, 2019 at 2:57 PM
Subject: Proposal of consultancy project.
To: <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

Dear Sir/Madam,

With the subject cited above, we would like to know your interest in the
collaborative research proposal discussed earlier. If you are interested
please send the budget details along with the stages of execution of the
work.

Thanks&Regards
Madeesh SK
Head-Operations
Inception Source Pvt.Ltd
Mob:7032646233,

hitps://mall.google.com/mail//0?ik=6151552dfd &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f03A 1710066002047 9569458simpl=msg-%3A17 1006600204, 1/1



GY2219, 3115 PM Gmail - Fwd: Release of funds

Fwd: Release of funds
1 message

Wed; Jun 12, 2019:at4:57 PM.

----- - Forwarded message --=«----~
From: <info@inceplionsource.in>
Date: Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 4:57 PM
Subject: Release of funds

To: <drkatla@stpaulscollege, ac.in>

Dear Sir;

We are pleased to inform you that our team of experts have accepted your
proposal and budget. In this regard, we are releasing a number of cne
lakh rupees to initiate the project.

Thanks & Regards

Madeesh SK
Head-Operations

Inception Source Pvt.Ltd WV
Mob:7032646233.

https:/imail google. com/mailiu/07ik=6151552dfd &view=ptésearch=all& permthid=thread-1%3A 1 7 10066975040474 182 &simpl=msg-f*%3A171006697504..,  1/1



Fwd: cost analysis 2019-20

1 message

DR KATLA <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in> Mon.APr8, 2019 at 10:20 AM

e Forwarded message -----—----

From: DR KATLA <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in>
Date: Mon,APr8, 2019 at 10:20 AM

Subject: cost analysis 2019-20

To: <info@inceptionsource.in>

Sub: Acceptance for consultancy project....reg

With reference to your previous mail, we would like to express our acceptance towards the
consultancy project discussed in our previous meeting . We are also sending an attachment
containing stages of work and cost analysis.

(5 —
with regards,
Dr.K. Venu Madhav
M. Pharm PhD,

Professor,



" .
INCEPTION
SOURCE ...

We find solutions

Date: 11/7/2018,
Hyderabad.
To

Dr .K. VENUMADHAY,
Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad.

Dear Sir,

Sub: Acceptance of Consultancy Projects

With reference to our previous meeting dated 16/5/2019 regarding our collaborative project
entitled Solubility Enhancement of Empagliflozin by Spherical Agglomeration and
Formulation as Sustained Release Oral Tablets.We express our acceptance and request you to
start the work immediately and we also look forward to submit in stipulated time. Inception
source Pvt Itd is always ready to consider your valuable suggestions and any constructive

changes towards the project. Thank you.

Yours Sincerely,

G
SK.MADER

Director,
Inception Source Pvt Ltd

Inception Source Pvt. Ltd.
Corporate Office: H. No: 11-13-1427, 2nd Floor, Nirmal Sadan, Kothapet, Hyderabad — 35



o5
. INCEPTION
SOURCE....

We find solutions

Date: 11/7/2018,
Hyderabad.
To

Dr K. VENUMADHAY,
Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad.

Dear Sir,

Sub: Acceptance of Consultancy Projects

With reference to our previous meeting dated 16/5/2019 regarding our collabofa.tive project
entitled Solubility Enhancement of Empagliflozin by Spherical Agglomeration and
Formulation as Sustained Release Oral Tablets.We express our acceptance and request you to
start the work immediately and we also look forward to submit in stipulated time. Inception
source Pvt Itd is always ready to consider your valuable suggestions and any constructive

changes towards the project. Thank you.

Yours Sincerely,

Director,
Inception Source Pvt Ltd

Inception Source Pvt. Ltd.

‘ Comorate Office: H. No: 11-13-1427, 2nd Floor, Nirmal Sadan, Kothapet, Hyderabad — 35



THN2N8;2:52.PM: Gmall - Fwd: Approvel of the Research Wark

Fwd "Approval of the Research Work

1 message

————— Forwarded message ssmme--e
From: <info@incentionsource.in>

Date: Wed, Jul, 11, 2018 at 2:58 PM
Subject: Approval of the Research Work
To: <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

“Desir SiriMadam;

We are happy to inform you that we have approved the proposal and
released an initial amount of 90000 towards the project. thank you.

Thanks & Regards
Madeesh SK
Head-Operations
Inception Source Pvt Ltd
Mob:7032646233

(B~

https:#/mail google.com/mail/u/07ik=6151552dfd &view=pt&search=all&permihid=thread-1263A17 1096700821 7940847 &simpl=msg-1%3aA1 71096700821, . 1/1



Ny Gmail

Fwd: Cost analysis 2018-19

1 message

Gmail - Fwd: Cost analysis 2018-19

DR KATLA <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

— Forwarded message
From: DR KATLA <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in>
Date: Fri, May11 2018 at 10:21 AM

Subject: Cost analysis 2018-19

To: <info@inceptionsource.in>

Sub: Acceptance of the proposal

Fri, Mayt1 2018 at 10:21 AM

With reference to your previous mail, we are pleased to inform you of our acceptance towards the
consultancy project discussed earlier. We are also sending an attachment containing stages of

work and cost analysis.

with regards,
Dr.K. Venu Madhav

M. Pharm PhD,
Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy

-B cost analysis 2018-2019.pdf
623K

Uit —



5/22/18, 2:25 PM Gmail
8 o
M Gmail

i Forwarded message ~swsn=e-x
From: <info@inceplionsource.in>

Date: Wed, May 16, 2018 at 4:58 PM
Subject: Proposal of consultancy project
To: <drkatla@stpaulscollege.ac.in>

Dear SirfMadam
Sub: Consultancy project ....reg.

With the above-cited subject, we would like to know your i

nterest in the

project we discussed in the last meeting. if you are interested please

send the budget details for the same
Thanksé& Regards

Madeesh SK
Head-Operation

Incepti PviLtd
Mob.7032646233, SBWUO—

hitlps//meil.google, comimail/u07k=615 1552dldBuTew=pt&scarchagligperm



Preparation and Characterization of Spherical
Agglomerates of diabetic drug by direct compression
method and a comparative evaluation with innovative

tablets

A Consultancy Project

Submitted to

Inception Source Pvt Ltd — Hyderabad
By
Dr. K.Venu Madhav M.Pharm PhD
Professor,
Department of Pharmaceutics

St.Pauls College of Pharmacy,

8 St.Pauls

L College of Pharmacy

(Approved by AICTE. PC) and Affikated 10 Osmania University)

Department of Pharmaceutics,
Turkhyamzal, Abdullapurmet (M)-501510,
Rangareddy Dist,

Telangana

May-2019



@ St.Pauls

College of Pharmacy

(Approved by AICTE, PCI and Affiliated to Osimania University)

2018-2019

Title: Preparation and Characterization of Spherical Agglomerates of diabetic drug by
direct compression method and a comparative evaluation with innovative tablets

Principal Investigator: Dr. K. Venu Madhav M. Pharm PhD
CO-Investigator  : Mr.S Kiran Kumar M. Pharm

« literature review
* Procurement of Chemicals N
* Preparation of Formulations
—?
<

Characterization & Evaluation

Cost Analysis
: Paramcter Amount in Rupees
‘._ 1 - Man power - 79,450
L 2 - Consumables - 95,550 -
3 Contingencies 25,000 |
‘___ 4 OverheadCharges 15000
| Total 215000

Principal Principal InvestigatorCo-Investigator
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. INCEPTION
SOURCE PVYT.ATD

We find solutions

Date: 12/6/2019,
Hyderabad.

To

Dr K. VENUMADHAYV,
Professor,

St. Pauls College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad.

Dear Sir,

Sub: Acceptance of Consultancy Projects

With reference to our previous meeting dated 10/4/2019 regarding our collaborative project
entitled Formulation and Evaluation of Self Nano Emulsifying Drug Delivery system for
Tamoxifen, we are delighted to express our acceptance. We request you to start the work
immediately and we also look forward to submit in stipulated time. Inception source Pvt Itd is
always ready to consider your valuable suggestions and any constructive changes towards the

project. Thank you.

Yours Sincerely,

SK.MADEESH

Director,
Inception Source

Inception Source Pvt. Ltd.
Corporate Office: H. No: 11-13-1427, 2nd Floor, Nirmal Sadan, Kothapet, Hyderabad - 35

s T W N T (Y )

i ! | | g — D



5.7.3 A Consultancy (from Industry) (10)
5.7.3 A.1 Details of Consultancy projects (2020-21CAY)

Project title Duration Funding Amount (in | Research
agency rupees) progress
Design and evaluation of | 12 months Sura Labs 215000.00 Completed

Chronomodulated ~ drug  delivery
systems by selected Drugs

Total amount(X)

:215000.00
5.7.3 A .2 Details of Consultancy projects (2019-2020CAY)
Project title Duration Funding Amount  (in | Research
agency rupees) progress
Formulation and evaluation of Self | 12 months Inception 225000.00 Completed

Nano Emulsifying Drug Delivery Source Pvt Ltd
System for Tamoxifen

Total amount(Y)

:225000.00
5.7.3 .3 Details of Consultancy projects (2018-2019 CAY)
Project title Duration Funding Amount (in | Research
agency rupees) progress
Preparation and Characterization of | 12 months Inception 215000.00 Completed

Spherical Agglomerates of diabetic Source Pvt Ltd
drug by direct compression method
and a comparative evaluation with
innovative tablets

Total amount (Z)
:215000.00

Cumulative Amount (x+y+z) =655000.00
5.7.3. B Unnat Bharath Abhiyan (UBA)

St.Pauls College of Pharmacy is now the partnering institutions selected under Unnat Bharat
Abhiyan, a flagship program of Ministry of Human Resource Development (MHRD)
government of India. As per the programme, educational institutions develop link with selective
rural clusters, involved in planning process and to promote requisite S&T improvise and expedite
the developmental efforts in those clusters.

Under UBA every participating institute is to adopt a cluster of five villags in consultation with
districts collector. Our institution has proposed the following villages of Ranga Reddy district.

Manchal, Lingampally, Chittapur, Dadpally, Thippaiguda

gl —

Principal

St. Paul’s College of Phar_mlcy
Tirkavamial, R R Bistrict.
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College of Pharmacy

(Approved by AICTE, PCI & Affiliated to Osmania University)

Lr. No. spop/plmrm/Acad/zozo-z1/[ 21 Dt: 20.03.2021

To,

District Collector,
RangaReddy,
Telangana,

Subject: Identification of villages under the UBA program.
Dear Sir,

Ministry of Human Resources Development (MHRD), Government of India has
launched the national program called Unnat Bharat Abhiyan (UBA), with the
vision to involve professional and higher educational institutions in the
development process of rural areas in the country to achieve sustainable
development and better quality of life. Indian Institute of Technology, Hauz Khas,

New Delhi has been designated to be the National Coordinating Institute by the
Ministry.

Our Institution St.Pauls College of Pharmacy and AISHE code C-25962 has
agreed to participate in UBA as a Participating Institute (PI).

Dr.M Kiranmai, Contact-No. 9052001390 and Email-Id:
drkiranmaim@stpaulscollege.ac.in, has been duly authorized in this regard from
our side to carry on the activities of UBA in our organization as Project
Coordinator.

Under the UBA program every Participating Institute is to adopt a cluster of five
villages in consultation with the Districts Collector. This is to bring to your kind
notice that we have proposed the following villages in the district Ranga Reddy.

1.MANCHAL o <an |
2.LINGAMPALLY 5085 $Otadig |
3.CHITTAPUR | ® - ‘ i
4.DADPALLY ] |

71 ]
MAQ 1/ 1
= (AN LV L)

5. THIPPAIGUDA

r~s

[n view of the above the Project Coordinator may contact your officer for the ‘ i
purpose. We request you to please help and cooperate in the matiter. TS e

}
!

Vith regards P o
Your Sincerely %IW]

(Dr.B Chandra Shekar)
Copy to UBA IIT Delhi

Upy

Principal
St. Paul’s College of Pharmac
Turkayamjal, R.R Distrigt

. ' g Turkayamjal Village, Sagar Road, Abdullapurmet Mandal, R.R. Dist., Telangana State - 501510
Adj. to Tu !

(I: 9390605800, E-mail: info@stpaulscollege.ac.in, www.stpaulscollege.ac.in
Cell: SOV



7/26/2016 Gmail - SB/SS/506/16-17

E""\f'l Gmall HYMA RK <rkhymapharma@gmail.com>
SB/SS/505/16-17
Seminar Symposia Section, SERB <seminarsymposia@gmail.com> Tue, Jul 26, 2016 at 2:54 PM

To: rkhymapharma@gmail.com
Cc: Ramesh V <drvramesh@serb.gov.in>, Satish Marar F&BO <finance@serb.gov.in>

R sl sehfaard arraueT 9t
Science and Engineering Research Board
(Rt 3ikt sl R & sl v wdunfors am, SR §@FR)
(A Statutory Body under Dept. of Science & Technology, Govt. of India)

Dated: 26 Julv 2016

Seminar Symposia Section

Dear Madam/Sir,

Please find attached a scanned copy of the new SERB Sanction Order issued for the Seminar Symposia assistance
sought by you as well as a copy of the format of the Utilization Certificate (UC) required to be submitted by you. And
ignore the earlier one as the money couldn't released against that due to financial year transition.

Kindly note that the amount of assistance as approved in the Sanction Order will be transferred to your Institute by the
SERB in the shortest possible time (approx. in three weeks). The UTR number and other details regarding funds
transferred to your institute in respect of your Sanction Order will be intimated to you by the Finance Wing, SERB
(via finance@serb.gov.in), after the funds are transferred.

You are also requested to use Logo of SERB, attached with this E-mail, on all Conferences / Seminars /
Symposium material being used for this event.

Kindly note that, no separate communication by post would be sent to you in this regard.

With Kind Regards,

Seminar Symposia Section,
Science and Engineering Research Board (SERB),
5 & 5A, Lower Ground Floor,

Vasant Square Mall, ’
Sector-B, Pocket-5, W
Vasant Kunj, U AN N\
New Delhi - 110 070. —
Email Id: seminarsymposia@gmail.com )
Contact No. 011- 40000380 /309 prmmil’d"ﬁ Sharmacy
0
st. Pauls .GO‘E%B Dist-501 510

kaya mia,
https://mail.google.com/mail/w/1/?ui=28ik=98867c6ba18view=pt&search=inbox&msg= 1562&3‘3922!2!}0001 &sim|=156268592d6b00c1 1/



7/26/2016 Gmail - SB/SS/505/16-17
3 attachments

@ Order_SB_SS__ 505_16-17.pdf
94K

Utli1zation Certificate.doc
23K

rincipa
at, Pauls Coueqe 0

\ n)

ph rmacy

veing

https://mail google.com/mail/w1/?ui=28ik=98867c6ba18view=ptésearch=inbox&msg=156268592d6b00c1&sim|=156268592d6b00c 1
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SB/SS/505/16-17
Science and Engineering Research Board

(SERB)
5& 54, Lower Ground Floor,
Vasant Square Mall, Sector-8,
Pocket-5, Vasant Kunj,
New Delhi-110070
Dated: 25 July 2016
ORDER

Subject: Financial assistance for organizing National Conference on "Histochemistry & Cytochemistry” by
Dr. P. Hyma, St. Paul's College of Pharmacy, Hyderabad- 501510 being held during 08-09 Sept.,
2016.

Kook

Sanction is hereby accorded to the payment of a sum of
% 75,000/-(Rupees Seventy Five Thousand Only) to the St. Paul's College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad- 501510 during the financial year 2016-2017 to meet the expenses related to TA/DA
to Young and Senior Indian Scientists and Pre-conference printing in connection with the above
event,

2. The amount of € 75,000/~ (Rupees Seventy Five Thousand Only) will be drawn by
Finance & Budget Officer, SERB and disbursed to the St. Paul's College of Pharmacy,

Hyderabad- 501510 by means of Cheque or Electronic Fund Transfer (NEFT / RTGS) as per
beneficiary’s Bank Details given below:

_"_Bilk Account Name [ st. Pauls College of Pharmacy
Bank Account Number 891110847 N R
Bank Name & Branch | Indian Bank, S.D Road, Secunderabad, Hyderabad -
Bank IFSC Code IDIBO00S013
Email Id of PI _ rkhymapharma@gmail._cba . I
Email [d of Beneficiary stp;ulgcollegeofpharmacy@gmail.com )
Email Id of Signatory | drvramesh@serb.gov.in, seminarsymposia@gmail.com o

3. The expenditure involved is debitable to “Fund for Science & Engineering Research (FSER)".
This release is being made under “Seminar Symposia Scheme”.

4. This sanction is issued with the approval of competent authority under delegated powers and
vide sanction number SERB/F/2392/2016-17dated 23/07/2016.

5. As per Rule 211(1) of GFRs, the accounts of the Grantee Institution shall be open to inspection by
the sanctioning authority/audit whenever the institute is called upon to do so.

6. It is mandatory that the grantee institution is required to submit to thisoffice,audited Statement
of Income-Expenditure, Utilization Certificate (in duplicate as per the enclosed prescribed
format) and brief report of the above event(max. 04 pages) within three months after the date of
completion,

7. The balance amount, if any, may be returned through DD in favor of “Fund for Science &
Engineering Research” payable at New Delhi.
8. The Logo of SERB is to be displayed on all Conferences / Seminars / Syl)upusium njaterial
being used for the event. L— AN
I (Dr. Ramesh V.) t)
Scientist-‘'C’

%t |2 . Conti.....

principal |
f Pharmaty

. Pauls College Of FIHd'L
STturkayamiaﬂ, R.R. Dist-581 510



To

Finance & Budget Officer,

Science and Engineering Research Board (SERB),
5 & 54A, Lower Ground Floor,

Vasant Square Mall, Sector-B,
Pocket-5,VasantKunj,

New Delhi-110070.

Copy forwarded for information and necessary action to:-

1. The Principal Director of Audit, A.G.C.RBuilding, 11l Floor L.P. Estate, Delhi-110002
2. Sanction Folder, SERB, New Delhi.

3. File Copy

4. Dr. P. Hyma,
Department of Pharmaceutical Chemistry,
St. Paul's College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad- 501510.
(Telangana)
Email Id- rkhymapharma@gmail.com

5. The Principal,
St. Paul's College of Pharmacy,
Hyderabad- 501510. /
(Telangana) Y t — Y/
N

(Dr.Ramesh V.)
Scientist-‘C’

Go Vo

Princ'\pa\f N
uls College O
S’\'t-;r‘.:aa\jam'\a\. R R. Dist-501 510,



8/22/2016 Gmall - RTGS/NEFT UTR/ TRANS No. —File No. SB/SS/605/16-17

M Gm a|| HYMA RK <rkhymapharma@gmail.com>

RTGSINEFT UTRI TRANS No. File No. SBISSI505I16 17

Finance Wing, SERB <finance@serb.gov.in> Sun, Aug 21, 2016 at 10:54 AM

To: rkhymaphama@gmail.com, stpaulscollegeofpharmacy@gmaﬂ com
Cc: "DR. V. RAMESH, SCIENTIST -'C™ <drvramesh@serb.gov.in>, ss <seminarsymposia@gmail.com>

Mr/Ms/Prof/Dr.

P HYMA

ST PAUL'S COLLEGE OF PHARMACY,
HYDERABAD -,501510
TELANGANA

Subject: RTGS/NEFT UTR/ TRANS No. - File No. SB/SS/505/16-17
Sir/Madam,

| am directed to refer to Science & Engineering Research Board (SERB) sanction order no. SB/SS/505/16-
17dated 25-07-2016 and forward herewith the following for information and necessary action:

RTGS/NEFT UTR/Transaction no.: UBINH16225089666 / SAA212863790 dated 12-08-2016.

Rs.75000/- (RUPEES SEVENTY FIVE THOUSAND ONLY) transferred to A/c No.: 891110847, Bank Name/Branch :
Indian Bank, SECUNDERABAD

Reference:

1, SERB, Finance Wing, Bill no: GIA/2246 dated 04-08-2016
2. SERB Finance Wing, Diary No: SERB/F/2392/2016-174 (please make this your subject line for future
queries via emalil)

KINDLY CONFIRM RECEIPT OF GRANTS (FUNDS) BY EMAIL ONLY.
IMPORTANT;
1. Mﬂw&m&ﬂ for Recurring and Non-Rocurring Grants (even if DISBURSED

NE S, ION_OR for your project) should be sent directly to the grant
Sanctlonlng Authonty by name (s:gnatory of the sanctlon order) within twelve months of the closure of the
which t 'S | i s of whether the s "

gmmm@_fgun!m_e_o_wp&

2. However, if any unspent balance is to be refunded, kindly ensure that the unutilized amount may be refunded
immediately by way of an a/c payee cheque/DD drawn in favour of :ﬂnmm_ﬁﬂgmggﬂﬂg
Research”, payable at New Delhi and rde e undersigne s given below:

The Finance & Budget Officer WA - .

Science & Engineering Research Board (SERB) PNHCIQ al

St. Pauls College of Pharmarv
hitps:/imall.google.com/mall//0/7ul=28lk=08867c6ba18view=pt&search=Inbox8msg=156abBeBofaf TEdhG I Hfigaoepp! °Pist- 501

H



IRD IIT Delhi
IIT CAMPUS HAUZ KHAS

PAYMENT ADVICE

To
PRINCIPAL ST PAULS COLLEGE OF PHARMACY

Dear Sir/Madam,

Details of the transactions initiated through SBI CMP in favour of you are

PAYMENT_INVOICE_FIELDS VALUES

UTR_NO SBIN521293365061

AMOUNT 50,000.00

DATE 20-10-2021

LINKAGE_FIELD

AMOUNT 50000

TAX DEDUCTED

PROJECT NO

OUT REF NO

DATE

GROSS AMOUNT 50000

TOWARDS PAYMENT TO PARTICIPATING INSTITUTE
WORKING UNDER UBA VIDE GEN23683

BANK NAME INDIAN BANK

ACCOUNT NO 891110847

IFSC CODE iDIB000S013

Your Bank Account No: 891110847
Your Bank IFSC Code: IDIB0O00S013

Please acknowledge receipt of the payment
For IRD IIT Delhi

Authorised Signatory
This is Computer generated advice and does not require any Signature

Holalgy

Principal ) ,
mac

st. Pauls College o.f Phar N2
Turkayamijal, R.R. Dist-501 510.



